

BIDS RECEIVED FOR May 11, 2021 2 PM AT ABERDEEN, SOUTH DAKOTA
ONE (1) REFUSE COLLECTION UNIT-PUBLIC WORKS DEPT

NAME OF BIDDER - ADDRESS OF BIDDER-		CRAWFORD TRUCKS & EQ. 3601 6TH AVE SE ABERDEEN, SD 57401		NORTHLAND TRUCK SALES, INC. PO BOX 55 WEST FARGO, ND 58078		ALLSTATE PETERBILT OF FARGO 3611 38TH STREET SW FARGO, ND 58104		SANITATION PRODUCTS 901 E 48TH ST N SIOUX FALLS, SD 57118	
DESCRIPTION									
ITEM 1	ONE (1) 2021 CAB & CHASSIS	\$84,150.00	NO BID	\$87,987.00	NO BID				
	YEAR	2022		2022					
	MAKE & MODEL	INTERNATIONAL HV607		PETERBILT 548					
	GVW	35,000 LBS		35,050 LBS					
	DELIVERY DATE	OCT. 2021		2/15/2022					
ITEM 2	ONE (1) REFUSE PACKER BODY	NO BID	\$66,177.00	NO BID	\$62,228.00				
	FURNISH AND INSTALL REFUSE PACKER BODY								
	YEAR MAKE & MODEL		2022 NEW WAY COBRA		2021 LOADMASTER LEGACY S				
	MFG.		SCRANTON MFG		LOADMASTER				
	CAPACITY		20 YD.		20 YD.				
	DELIVERY DATE		120-150 DAYS ARO		130-180 DAYS AFTER CHASSIS				
TRADE	LESS TRADE ALLOWANCE	\$25,000.00	\$42,197.00	\$32,500.00	\$45,000.00				
	2014 FREIGHTLINER TRUCK								
	SN: 1FVACYCYFHGC2129 WITH NEW WAY PACKER BODY (20 YD) #522								
	NET BID	\$59,150.00	\$23,980.00	\$55,487.00	\$17,228.00				
	BID SURETY?	5% CC	10% BB	10% BB	10% BB				

CERTIFIED BY:

5/12/2021

BIDS RECEIVED FOR ONE (1) REFUSE COLLECTION UNIT-PUBLIC WORKS DEPT
May 11, 2021 2 PM AT ABERDEEN, SOUTH DAKOTA

NAME OF BIDDER -		TRUCK CENTER CO.		TRUCK CENTER CO.		TRUCK CENTER CO.		TRUCK CENTER CO.	
ADDRESS OF BIDDER-		1501 N HWY 59 MARSHALL, MN 56258		1501 N HWY 59 MARSHALL, MN 56258		1501 N HWY 59 MARSHALL, MN 56258		1501 N HWY 59 MARSHALL, MN 56258	
DESCRIPTION	YEAR	2022	2022	2022	2022	2022	2022	2022	2022
ITEM 1	ONE (1) 2021 CAB & CHASSIS	\$81,634.00	\$81,634.00	\$81,634.00	\$81,634.00	\$81,634.00	\$81,634.00	\$81,634.00	\$81,634.00
MAKE & MODEL	FREIGHTLINER M2106	FREIGHTLINER M2106	FREIGHTLINER M2106	FREIGHTLINER M2106	FREIGHTLINER M2106	FREIGHTLINER M2106	FREIGHTLINER M2106	FREIGHTLINER M2106	FREIGHTLINER M2106
GVW	35,000 LBS.	35,000 LBS.	35,000 LBS.	35,000 LBS.	35,000 LBS.	35,000 LBS.	35,000 LBS.	35,000 LBS.	35,000 LBS.
DELIVERY DATE	MAY/JUNE 2022	MAY/JUNE 2022	MAY/JUNE 2022	MAY/JUNE 2022	MAY/JUNE 2022	MAY/JUNE 2022	MAY/JUNE 2022	MAY/JUNE 2022	MAY/JUNE 2022
ITEM 2	ONE (1) REFUSE PACKER BODY	\$69,710.00	\$67,710.00	\$80,565.00	\$78,565.00				
FURNISH AND INSTALL REFUSE									
PACKER BODY									
YEAR MAKE & MODEL	2021 QUANTUM CURBTENDER	2021 QUANTUM CURBTENDER	2021 FURY CURBTENDER	2021 FURY CURBTENDER	2021 FURY CURBTENDER				
MFG	CURTENDER	CURTENDER	CURBTENDER	CURBTENDER	CURBTENDER				
CAPACITY	20 YD.	20 YD.	20 YD.	20 YD.	20 YD.				
DELIVER DATE	120-150 DAYS AFTER CHASSIS	120-150 DAYS AFTER CHASSIS	120-150 DAYS AFTER CHASSIS	120-150 DAYS AFTER CHASSIS	120-150 DAYS AFTER CHASSIS				
TRADE	LESS TRADE ALLOWANCE	\$47,500.00	\$47,500.00	\$47,500.00	\$47,500.00				
	2014 FREIGHTLINER TRUCK								
	SN: 1FVACYCYFHGC2129 WITH								
	NEW WAY PACKER BODY (20 YD) #522								
	NET BID	\$103,844.00	\$101,844.00	\$114,699.00	\$112,699.00				
	BID SURETY?	10% BB	10% BB	10% BB	10% BB				

CERTIFIED BY: 